
India’s Expected Playing XI for 3rd 
Test Against England at Lord’s 

As the India vs England Test series reaches its crucial third match at the iconic Lord’s 
Cricket Ground, cricket fans eagerly await the playing XI that Team India will field. The 
London pitch and weather conditions, combined with the high stakes of the series, mean 
that the team management will carefully select a balanced side to challenge England on 
their home turf. 

 

Batting Line-Up 

India’s batting has shown resilience throughout the series, and the top order is expected 
to remain steady. Rohit Sharma, the experienced opener, will lead the charge alongside 
Shubman Gill, who has impressed with his solid technique and temperament. Cheteshwar 
Pujara’s gritty style makes him a vital middle-order presence, especially on the 
challenging Lord’s pitch. 



Captain Virat Kohli is likely to continue his role at number four, bringing his vast 
experience and ability to anchor the innings. Rishabh Pant will take the wicketkeeping 
duties while adding explosiveness to the middle order. 

All-Rounders and Bowlers 

The all-rounder spot is crucial for balance, and India may rely on Ravindra Jadeja’s 
left-arm spin and handy batting. His energy and sharp fielding will add value on a 
surface that may assist spin as the match progresses. 

The pace attack will be led by the impressive Jasprit Bumrah, whose ability to swing the 
ball both ways is a major weapon. He will likely be supported by Mohammed Siraj and 
Umesh Yadav, both of whom have shown good form and discipline. 

Key Considerations 

Lord’s traditionally offers something for both pacers and spinners, so India’s bowling unit 
will have to be adaptable. The inclusion of two spinners might depend on pitch reports 
closer to the match. 

Overall, the expected playing XI balances experience, youth, and skill diversity. The team 
management’s focus will be on resilience, patience, and tactical bowling to counter 
England’s strong batting lineup. 

Final Thoughts 

This Test at Lord’s is not just another match — it’s a chance for India to assert dominance 
in English conditions and keep their series hopes alive. Fans will be watching closely as 
the players take the field, hoping for a memorable performance at cricket’s “Home of 
Cricket. 

Related article:- India Predicted XI For 3rd Test Vs ENG 

 

https://icecric.news/india-predicted-xi-for-3rd-test-vs-eng/
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